
PR 2004/94A - Addendum - Income tax: Burbank Film
and Television Fund

This cover sheet is provided for information only. It does not form part of PR 2004/94A -
Addendum - Income tax: Burbank Film and Television Fund

View the consolidated version for this notice.

Generated on: 4 June 2026, 02:43:48 AM

https://www.ato.gov.au/law/view/document?DocID=%22PRR%2FPR200494%2FNAT%2FATO%2F00001%22&PiT=20050629000001


Product Ruling 

PR 2004/94 
FOI status:  may be released Page 1 of 1 

Addendum 
Product Ruling 
Income tax:  Burbank Film and Television 
Fund 
 

This Addendum amends Product Ruling PR 2004/94 to reduce the 
minimum subscription required to be achieved by 30 June 2005 from 
$11,636,245 to $5,475,880. 

 

PR 2004/94 is amended as follows: 
1. Paragraph 21 
Omit ‘$11,636,245’ from the last sentence and replace with 
‘$5,475,880’. 

Omit ‘17’ from the last sentence and replace with ‘8’. 

 

2. Paragraph 22 
Omit ‘17’ from the second sentence and replace with ‘8’. 

 

3. Paragraph 35 
Omit ‘$11,636,245’ and replace with ‘$5,475,880’. 

 

4. Paragraph 46 
Omit ‘$11,636,245’ from the first sentence and replace with 
‘$5,475,880’. 

 

This Addendum applies on and from 22 September 2004. 

 

 

Commissioner of Taxation 
29 June 2005 
 
ATO references 
NO: 2003/11684 
ISSN: 1441-1172 
ATOlaw topic: Income Tax ~~ Product ~~ film industry 
 


	Generated on: 4 June 2026, 02:43:48 AM
	Content

